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Manager's Introduction

This spring, we have been truly fortunate to experience some beautiful weather,
allowing us to bask in the warmth of the sun and enjoy the vibrant colours that
nature has to offer. 

We look forward to making the most of this delightful season together, with a variety
of activities and events that celebrate the beauty of spring. Join us as we embrace
this lovely time of year!

Also, if you know someone who would like to receive our email newsletters/updates
just let us know, or forward them the newsletter sign up link below:

Newsletter Sign-Up

Best wishes

Karlynn Wheelan
Care Home Manager

Upcoming Event

Get ready to dust off your dancing shoes, because we have a fabulous ABBA
afternoon lined up for all our dancing queens here at the care home! On May 7th,
we’ll be welcoming the incredible ABBA Tones for a live entertainment experience
that promises to get everyone moving.

So, dig out those party outfits, because we’re in for a fantastic afternoon filled with
nostalgic tunes and plenty of fun! And of course, no Boclair party would be complete
without a glass (or two) of refreshing Prosecco. So join us for an unforgettable
celebration!
 

Easter 2025

This year’s Easter celebrations were made truly special with our Garden Party. It
was a fantastic joy filled afternoon. We extend our heartfelt thanks to everyone who
joined us to make this event memorable. 

Living in Scotland means we have to seize every opportunity to enjoy the fresh air
and sunshine! Our residents love basking in the beauty of nature, so when the sun is
shining, you can bet we’re out enjoying it. To keep everyone comfortable and cool,
we make sure to have refreshing drinks on hand and don our stylish sun hats.

Lingo Flamingo – French Class

“Parlez-vous français?” If not, don’t worry! Our Lingo Flamingo French classes are
here to introduce everyone to the beautiful language of French. Our residents have
fun as we explore vocabulary, phrases, and conversation skills in an engaging and
supportive environment. It’s never too late to learn a new language!

Fun & Games

A huge thank you to FIT-BAW for delivering so many fantastic sessions filled with
energy and fun! Well done to each resident for taking part and also those who won
the Player of the Week! 

Our residents recently gathered for an exciting game of Bingo, where friendly
competition filled the air! With the familiar call of "Eyes down!" everyone showed
their enthusiasm and anticipation. The lively atmosphere was enhanced by laughter
and cheerful chatter as participants marked their cards, hoping for that winning line.

Our Arts and Crafts sessions have become a beloved part of our activities, where
creativity knows no bounds! Residents of all skill levels come together to draw,
colour, and create beautiful pieces of art. 

Valentine's Day

Valentine's Day was filled with sweetness and love as we indulged in chocolate-
covered strawberries and sipped on Prosecco. We also had a delightful surprise for
Karen, who won the Valentine’s hamper!

Keep In Touch

Make sure to check out the Boclair Care Home Facebook Page.
 

Don't Forget To 'Like' Us!
 

Leave A Review

We would be very grateful if you could spare a few minutes to write a review for us:

Carehome.co.uk Reviews

We have recently been upgraded on www.carehome.co.uk and now have a score of
9.9 (at time of writing). We really appreciate any reviews of our service, many

thanks.

Google Reviews

Thank you for taking the time to review Boclair. 
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